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Helping build empires one at a time 

 

The global economy is transitioning into a new era called the Fourth Industrial Revolution. With 
the Legacy Financial System or SWIFT becoming high-risk due to Quantum Computers, most 
of the population will be clueless on how to handle their finances. They aren’t sure on how to 
protect their investments or how to invest in general. They use this excuse to become a 
procrastinator. Procrastinating will be avoided by becoming a member of SpeCie LLC. SpeCie 
LLC is a digital currency service that coaches investors on how to handle their own assets the 
correct way. 

SpeCie LLC's strategic plan is to educate investors on different opportunities they never knew 
about. Compliance and safety is key when creating success for you or your company. Too many  
influencers are only given information to grow popularity. They don’t care about helping others 
understand the rules and will leave everyone behind after they rug pull them. This always 
backfires somewhere down the line for the influencers. Integrity is key at SpeCie LLC….but it 
comes with a price. 

To become a member of SpeCie LLC, you will have to join SPEC talk. SPEC talk is a 
membership class that gives in-depth conversation and talks about strategic ideas for Financial 



Freedom. Every member will use e-KYC exchanges for compliance.  Members will also receive 
an airdrop of SPEC tokens to manage their money. Here’s a list that SpeCie LLC will learn 
about: 

. Stake SPEC token for passive income. 

. Stake SpeCFTs (NFTs) for passive income. 

. Diversifying your portfolio to better position yourself financially. 

. Learn about the importance of private banking. 

. Learning about precious metals, wholesale life insurance, trust funds, and other financial 
tools. 

. Created presentations on educating investors.  

WARNING: 

NEVER sell all of your SPEC tokens. This token is NOT a memecoin! SPEC token is used to 
teach investors on how to earn passive income on Blockchain. If you break this rule, you’ll be 
permanently banished and your membership will be revoked. To see the tokenomics of SPEC 
token, go to our company’s website https://speciellc.xyz.  

 

 

SpeCie LLC recognizes that many companies only teach about making money and not handling 
their financial positions securely. The upcoming failure of the companies will be a lack of 
teaching investors about Quantum Computers and Quantum Resistant Technologies. Our 
company’s belief is to help misguided investors on the importance of Blockchain, and partner 
with other companies that are serious about digital currency safety. One example SpeCie LLC 
is committed to is teaching about anti-money laundering with e-KYC.  

SpeCie LLC has partnered with companies like Blockcycle Labs, Wealthwave, Dora’s Tacos, 
Vestige, Sandman AI, Tinyman, and a few other companies on Algorand. SpeCie LLC has just 

https://speciellc.xyz


joined the XRP community and is looking for more companies to collaborate with to build a 
better economy. To reach out to SpeCie LLC, e-mail marc@speciellc.xyz for further questions 
and details. The next goal is to build with other ISO 20022 coins in continuation to help build 
empires. 
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